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To: "Astroradio SL" <info@astroradio.com>
Subject: Re: [Astro Radio] Solicitud de informacion
Reply-to: matjaz.vidmar@fe.uni-1j.si

Date: Wed, 24 Aug 2016 09:29:58 -0000

Cc: "Tadeja Saje" <tadeja.saje@gmail.com>
From: Matjaz <matjaz.vidmar@fe.uni-1j.si>

Dear Salvador,
I just paid your invoice from my bank NKBM in Nova Gorica, Slovenia.
Please find enclosed a pdf of my payment.

Please send the DVBT dongles I ordered to my mailing address:

Matjaz Vidmar
Sergeja Masere 21
SI-5000 Nova Gorica
Slovenia

Thank you, Matjaz

On Tue, 23 Aug 2016 14:04:03 -0000, Astroradio SL <info@astroradio.com> wrote:

> 0On 22/08/16 ©9:05, matjaz.vidmar@fe.uni-1j.si wrote:

>>

>> Nombre : Matjaz Vidmar

>>

>> Mensaje:

>>

>>

>> Dear Sirs,

>> I would like to buy from you (two pieces) DVBT compatible dongles:
>> Receptor RTL-SDR Blog R820T2 RTL2832U

>> as advertised on your web page.

>> Can you send me this material to my mailing address:

>> Matjaz Vidmar, Sergeja Masere 21, 5000 Nova Gorica, Slovenia,
>> (European Community).

>> Please send me an invoice to pay from my bank account.

>> Thank you, Matjaz

>>
>

>

> attached proforma invoice

>

> items in stock for inmediate delivery.
>

> Best regards

> Salvador Caballé
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